Penn Cambria School District 2024-2025 Bid Tabulations

Bid Opening - 5/3/2024
INITIAL BID TABULATIONS

A.

B.

Mcllwain School Bus Lines

Primary Bid

Alternate Bid

Markup
on day of delivery

Firm price per

(+DTN or OPIS DTN gallon
Rack Average per or for Comments
Vendor gallon) OPIS 1 year

Gasoline - 5 Bids Received
Glassmere Fuel Service, Inc. Curtisville, PA 0.0439 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Satterlee Resources Rochester Mills, PA 0.0439 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Friday Gas & Qil, Inc. Weedville, PA -0.0150 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona
Er?dsglnterp”se LLC dba Smith Coal |\ therm Cambria, PA 0.0410 OPIS | NoBid |Terminal Location: Altoona, PA

Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Sunoco LLC Dallas, TX 0.1000 OPIS No Bid Will utilitze subcontractors/

common carriers to deliver
Diesel - 7 Bids Received

0.0089
Glassmere Fuel Service, Inc. Curtisville, PA *Add .035 for OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
winter additive

Satterlee Resources Rochester Mills, PA 0.0082 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Friday Gas & OiIl, Inc. Weedville, PA -0.0150 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona

Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Sunoco LLC Dallas, TX 0.0050 OPIS No Bid Will utilitze subcontractors/

common carriers to deliver
Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN -0.0333 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
EBS Enterprise LLC dba Smith , . . .
Coal and Oil Northern Cambria, PA 0.0095 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Bedford Valley Petroleum & Propane |Everett, PA 0.0085 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona
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2024-25 Bid-GAS & DIESEL

5/3/2024, 3:45 PM




Cambria/lndiana Schools Joint Fuel Purchasing Consortium 2024-2025 Bid Tabulations

Bid Opening - 5/3/2024
INITIAL BID TABULATIONS

A. B.
Primary Bid Alternate Bid
Markup
on day of delivery DTN Firm price per
(+DTN or OPIS Rack or gallon for Comments
Vendor Average per gallon) OPIS 1 year
Heating Oil - 7 Bids Received
. L . Terminal Location: Altoona, PA

Glassmere Fuel Service, Inc. Curtisville, PA 0.0089 OPIS No Bid Brand: Major Brand/Unbranded
Satterlee Resources Rochester Mills, PA 0.0078 OPIS No Bid Termlr_lal LO.Cat'O”: Altoona, PA

Brand: Not listed
Friday Gas & Oil, Inc. Weedville, PA -0.0150 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona

Brand: Unbranded
EBS E_nterprlse LLC dba Smith Coal Northern Cambria, PA 0.0095 OPIS No Bid Termnjlal Lo_catlon: Altoona, PA
and Oil Brand: Not listed

Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Sunoco, LLC Dallas, TX 0.0050 OPIS No Bid Brand: Sunoco/Various

Will utilitze subcontractors/

common carriers to deliver

Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN 0.0269 OPIS No Bid Brand: Various to include Valero,

United, Buckeye, etc.
Bedford Valley Petroleum & Propane|Everett, PA 0.0085 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Not listed

Brand: Not listed
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2024-25 Joint Bid-HEATING OIL
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Cambrial/lndiana Schools Joint Fuel Purchasing Consortium 2024-2025 Bid Tabulations

Bid Opening - 5/3/2024
INITIAL BID TABULATIONS

Northern Cambria SD

NCHS NCMS
Additional per Ton
Washed Washed to treat washed w/
Vendor Per Ton Per Ton Anti-icing material
Coal - 2 Bids Received
Penn Keystone Coal Co., LLC Johnstown, PA $157.50 $157.50 N/A
RFI Resources, LLC Indiana, PA $201.25 $201.25 N/A
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2024-25 Joint Bid - COAL

5/3/2024, 3:12 PM
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