Penn Cambria School District 2022-2023 Bid Tabulations

FINAL AWARDED RESULTS

Bid Opening 05/06/2022

A.

B.

Mcllwain School Bus Lines

Primary Bid Alternate Bid
Markup
on day of delivery Firm price per
(+DTN or OPIS DTN gallon
Rack Average per or for Comments
Vendor gallon) OPIS 1 year
Gasoline - 4 Bids Received
Friday Gas & Qil, Inc. Weedville, PA 0.0550 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona
Glassmere Fuel Service, Inc. Curtisville, PA 0.0986 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Jacobs Oil Co., Inc. Dysart, PA 0.1200 DTN No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Gladieux Trading and Marketing Fort Wayne, IN 0.1497 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Company, LP
Diesel - 4 Bids Received
Glassmere Fuel Service, Inc. Curtisville, PA 0.0255 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Friday Gas & Qil, Inc. Weedville, PA 0.0100 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona
Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN 0.0291 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Gladieux Trading and Marketing Fort Wayne, IN 0.0397 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Company, LP

N:\Business Office\Bidding\Fuel\Fuel_General\Bid_Tabulations.xIsx
2022-23 Bid-GAS & DIESEL
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Cambria/lndiana Schools Joint Fuel Purchasing Consortium 2022-2023 Bid Tabulations

Joint Bids
FINAL AWARDED RESULTS

Bid Opening 05/06/2022

A. B.
Primary Bid Alternate Bid
Markup
on day of delivery DTN Firm price per
(+DTN or OPIS Rack or gallon for Comments
Vendor Average per gallon) OPIS 1 year

Heating Oil - 4 Bids Received

Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Glassmere Fuel Service, Inc. Curtisville, PA 0.0297 OPIS No Bid Brand: Major brand or

unbranded

0.01
AL Terminal Location: Altoona
Friday Gas & Qil, Inc. Weedville, PA Penn Cambria SD OPIS No Bid _ ) '
. ) Brand: Not listed
Cambria Heights SD
Northern Cambria SD

Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN 0.0196 OPIS No Bid Brand: Various to include

Valero, United, Buckeye, etc.

Terminal Location: Altoona, PA
Gladieux Trading and Marketing Fort Wayne, IN 0.0447 OPIS No Bid Brand: Various to include

Company, LP

Sunoco, Valero, United,
Buckeye, etc.
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Cambria/Indiana Schools Joint Fuel Purchasing Consortium 2022-2023 Bid Tabulations

Joint Bids
FINAL AWARDED RESULTS

Penn Cambria SD

Northern Cambria SD

Bid Opening 05/06/2022

PCHS PCMS NCHS NCMS
Additional per Ton
Washed Washed Washed Washed to treat washed w/
Vendor Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Anti-icing material
Coal - 2 Bids Received
Penn Keystone Coal Co., LLC Claysburg, PA $162.00 $164.00 $159.00 $159.00 Blank
Wicklow Fuel Co Inc. Gallitzin, PA $244.00 | $244.00 | $251.50 | $251.50 Blank

Non-Collusion Affidavit NOT Notarized
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