Cambria/lndiana Schools Joint Fuel Purchasing Consortium 2016-2017 Bid Tabulations

Joint Bids

Bid Opening

05/25/2016

FINAL AWARDED RESULTS

A.

A.

[ B

Wilkinson Bus Lines

Tri-County Transportation

Primary Bid Alternate Bid Primary Bid Alternate Bid
Markup Markup
on day of delivery Firm price per on day of delivery Firm price per
(+DTN or OPIS DTN gallon (+DTN or OPIS DTN gallon
Rack Average per or for Rack Average per or for Comments
Vendor gallon) OPIS 1 year gallon) OPIS 1 year
Gasoline - 1 bid received
Jacobs Qil Co., Inc. Dysart, PA 0.12000 DTN No Bid 0.25000 DTN Blank Terminal Location: Altoona
Diesel - 2 bids received
Terminal Location: Altoona
Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN -0.00320 OPIS 1.8184 * No Bid No Bid No Bid * Firm Price Requires Conditional
Clauses -- willing to discuss
William G. Satterlee & Sons, Inc. Rochester Mills, PA 0.06050 OPIS No Bid 0.09890 OPIS No Bid Terminal Location: Altoona
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Cambria/Indiana Schools Joint Fuel Purchasing Consortium 2016-2017 Bid Tabulations

Bid Opening 05/25/2016

Joint Bids FINAL AWARDED RESULTS
A. B.
Primary Bid Alternate Bid
Markup
on day of delivery DTN Firm price per gallon
(+DTN or OPIS Rack or for Comments
Vendor Average per gallon) OPIS 1 year
Fuel Oil - 2 bids received
- . Terminal Location: Altoona
William G. Satterlee & Sons, Inc. Rochester Mills, PA 0.0313 OPIS N/A
Brand: PPT-Altoona
Terminal Location: Altoona
Brand: Various to include Pyramid,
Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN 0.0451 OPIS 1.8321* Buckeye, Valero, etc.

* Firm Price Requires Conditional
Clauses -- willing to discuss
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Cambria/lndiana Schools Joint Fuel Purchasing Consortium 2016-2017 Bid Tabulations

Bid Opening 05/25/2016
FINAL AWARDED RESULTS

Coal - 2 bids received
Penn Cambria SD Northern Cambria SD
PCHS PCMS NCHS NCMS
Additional per Ton
Washed Washed Washed Washed to treat washed w/
Vendor Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Per Ton Anti-icing material
Collins Brokerage Pittsburgh, PA | $105.85 $107.85 Blank Blank $0.00
Penn Keystone Coal Co., LLC (Claysburg, PA $110.80 $116.80 $113.80 $113.80 Blank
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